
CITY OF

OAK RIDGE

rcHYCj?

POST OFFICE BOX 1 • OAK RIDGE. TENNESSEE 37831-0001

OAK RIDGE CITY COUNCIL

WORK SESSION

AGENDA

September 22, 2014

7:00 p.m.—Call to order In the Multipurpose Room, Central Services Complex

I. Advance review of the pass-through TVAWholesale Power Rate Increase (scheduled for the
special City Council meeting on September 29, 2014).

II. Discussion and preliminary review of Annual Climate Action Plan Progress Report from EQAB
Chair Steve Kenworthy.

III. Discussion and request to modify membership/composition of the Elder Citizens Advisory Board
prior to committee solicitation in Fall 2014.

IV. Discussion and review of minor changes to the Oak Ridge Property Maintenance Code to conform
with Administrative Hearing Officer program and description clarifications.

V. Discussion and scheduling of meeting with Board of Education on CIP needs and financial
projections for advance development of FY 2016 Budget.

VI. Upcoming Agenda Items:
A. Special City Council meeting concerning Main Street - Oak Ridge retail project

(September 29, 2014, at 7:00 p.m.)

VII. Updates from City Manager;
A. Friendship Bell Project (status)
B. Submittal of TVA Extreme Energy Makeover Grant (status)
C. Management reports from City Manager
S. Quarterly Finance Reports

VIII. Upcoming Meetings:
A. Annual Intergovernmental Meeting with DOE, November 12-14, 2014, New Orleans,

Louisiana

B. National League of Cities Congress of Cities and Expositions, November 19-22, 2014,
Austin, Texas.

C. Special City Council Meeting request to discuss comprehensive review of DOE
assistance to City of Oak Ridge

IX. Adjournment.



FINANCE DEPARTMENT MEMORANDUM

14-18

DATE; September 15, 2013

TO: Mark S.Watson, City Manager

FROM: Janice E. McGlnnis, Finance Director

SUBJECT: TVA WHOLESALE POWER RATE INCREASE

On August 21, 2014, TVA's Board of Directors approved an increase to wholesale power rates charged to
its electric distributors, which Includes the City of Oak Ridge, effective with the wholesale power invoice
billings for the month of October 2014. The City cannot absorb this rate increase and it needs to be
passed through onto the City's electric customers. Chris Mitchell, the City's electric rate consultant, has
provided the necessary retail electric rate adjustments to cover the increased wholesale power costs to
the City from TVA. The increase to the average residential customer using 972 kWh monthly is $1.47, a
1.45% increase for that user. The increase to the average small commercial customer using 1,613 kWh
monthly is $2.69, a 1.38% increase for that user.

A special meeting of City Council will need to be scheduled prior to the end of September in order for
Council to consider for approval a resolution authorizing a contract amendment between the City of Oak
Ridge and the Tennessee Valley Authority (TVA) to establish new rates for the City's electric system
effective with the October 2014 electric billings.

Jani6^. McGinnis



CITY COUNCIL MEMORANDUM
14-31

DATE: September 19, 2014

TO: Honorable Mayor and Members of City Council

FROM: Mark S. Watson, City Manager

SUBJECT: COMPOSITION OF ELDER CITIZENS ADVISORY BOARD

This past week, I was approached by the Chair of the Elder Citizens Advisory Board, Liz Batchelor,
concerning the current composition of the Board. The Board makeup consists of representatives of
various associations, such as AARP and Retired Teachers Association. Attendance has been sporadic
and participation by some representative groups has been limited. Only three positions are selected by
the City Council from the public at large. The City Clerk has found It difficult to fill some positions.

As the new selection process is faced around the corner for the 2015 year, it has been suggested that the
composition be re-vislted and consider a normal appointment of interested individuals by the City Council
during our normal appointment process. Since the Elder Citizens Advisory Board positions are
designated. It would be appropriate to consider amending the resolution establishing the Board and
consider reducing or eliminating the categories reserved for senior organizations, instead, the City
Council could consider those seniors both younger and older who could establish future senior citizen
services and needs. Perhaps, those individuals who offer expertise In senior health, transportation
services, independent living services, and law enforcement might be more representative of the service
areas to be studied by this Board.

As we move forward to an advertising process for vacancies in the coming year. It Is appropriate to
discuss this now as the City Cierk prepares for her upcoming solicitation process.

Mark S. Watson



TO: Mark Watson, Oak Ridge City Manager and Members of the Oak
Ridge City Council

FROM: Liz Board Chair

SUBJ: Board Restructuring and Membership Changes

DATE: 17 September 2014

The Oak Ridge Senior Advisory Board was unable to reach a quorum to discuss new
methods of selecting membership for the board. In the past, specific positions on
the board were associated with senior organizations in the community. However, in
recent years, this method has become somewhat less successful.

First, the organizations have become very old by their own membership
designations and, therefore, have no members willing or able to serve on our board.
Second, the activities on our board have become less directed toward recreation and
more involved with senior education and safety. This programming needs board
members more aware of the needs of the whole senior community and the
resources available to meet these needs.

It might be more prudent to establish a pro tem committee of eight to ten
individuals who are knowledgeable about senior issues and ask them to redefine the
committee and suggest the best way to designate members for election. The timing,
whether after city council elections, before committee elections, or at some other
time would be up to council's discretion.

I am listing a few names below that have been suggested as possible committee
members should you decide to appoint a committee. Otherwise, our board will
continue to struggle to resolve this issue. Your input and comments are always
welcome.

Doris Doherty
Bob Cantrell

Lynne Burchell
Steve Whitson

Liz Batchelor

jenny Caughman



ELDER CITIZENS' ADVISORY BOARD

STRUCTURE

Established by Resolution Number 7-75-77, as amended, under the authority granted in Article

III, Section 5, of the City Charter.

Composition: The Elder Citizens' Advisory Board is composed of eleven (11) members appointed

by City Council for three-year staggered terms of office. The Board includes one (1)

representative each from the American Association of Retired Persons, National Association of

Retired Federal Employees, Retired Teachers Association, Senior Citizens Club, The 43 Club,

the Anderson County Council on Aging, the Anderson County Adult Safety Coalition and

ElderWatch, and the Coalition of Oak Ridge Retired Employees (CORRE). The remaining three

(3) members are elected from the public at large. Officers of the Board are elected annually and

consist of a chairman, a vice-chairman, and secretary.

General Powers and Duties: The Board advises and assists the Council in developing and

assessing elder citizen programs and services. In the performance of its functions, it may conduct

studies regarding development and maintenance of activity and service programs for elder

citizens, cooperate with other groups and organizations in this regard, make policy

recommendations for use of the Senior Center, and adopt rules and procedures for the conduct

of its meetings.

Meetings: The Board meets on the first Monday of each month at the Senior Center.

19



COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT MEMORANDUM

14-39

DATE: September 19, 2014

TO: Mark S. Watson, City Manager

FROM: Matthew Widner, Kathryn Baldwin

SUBJECT: 2012 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE (IPMC)

—

An item for City Council's discussion is the proposed adoption of the 2012 IPMC with amendments. The
current property maintenance code is the 2003 version that was last amended in 2007. The City has
already adopted the 2012 suite of construction codes causing the current IPMC to be outdated.

Significant changes to proposed amendments adds language to recognize the use of the City's new
Administrative Hearing Officer, reinstates previously deleted "Emergency Measures," "Demolition" and
"Fire Safety Requirements" provisions for housing, defines and recognizes the legal use native gardens,
redefined unlawful structures, added "extensive alteration" provisions for reconstruction requirements and
added provisions to address open storage or accumulation of indoor items in the elements outside
porches, decks and carports. The current provisions regulating the city Board of Building and Housing
Code Appeals and their function remain essentially the same but has been reformatted to fit within the
2012 IPMC section numbering scheme.

Attachmentfs)

Draft amendments for the proposed 2012 International Property Maintenance Code adoption.



ADOPTION Of THE OAK RIDGE PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE ORDINANCE NO.

An Ordinance of the Cityof Oak Ridge,Tennessee adopting the 2012 edition of the International Property Maintenance
Code (IPMC), to include Appendix A Boarding Standard as amended, regulating and governing the conditions and
maintenance of all property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and
other physical things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use;
and the condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use, and the demolition of such
existing structures in the City of Oak Ridge, Tennessee; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees
therefor; repealing Title 13 "Property Maintenance Regulations" Chapter 2 "Oak Ridge Property Maintenance Code" and
all other ordinances or parts of laws in conflict therewith in its entirety and adopting a new Title 13 "Property
Maintenance Regulations" Chapter 2 "Oak Ridge Property Maintenance Code" Ordinance in lieu thereof. By Ordinance
No. of the City of Oak Ridge, Tennessee.

The City Council of the City of Oak Ridge, Tennessee does ordain as follows:

Section 1. That a certain document, three (3) copies of which are on file in the office of the City Clerk of The City of Oak
Ridge, Tennessee being marked and designated as the International Property Maintenance Code, 2012 edition, as
published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby adopted as the "Oak Ridge Property Maintenance Code"
of the City of Oak Ridge, in the State of Tennessee for regulating and governing the conditions and maintenance of all
property, buildings and structures; by providing the standards for supplied utilities and facilities and other physical
things and conditions essential to ensure that structures are safe, sanitary and fit for occupation and use; and the
condemnation of buildings and structures unfit for human occupancy and use, and the demolition of such existing
structures as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor; and each and all of
the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Property Maintenance Code on file in the office of
the City Clerk are hereby referred to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this legislation, with the
additions, insertions, deletions and changes, if any, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance.

Section 2. The following sections are hereby revised:

Section 101.1 Title. Delete in its entirety and Insert a new section: "Section 101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known
as the Oak Ridge Property Maintenance Code of the City of Oak Ridge, Tennessee, hereinafter referred to as "this code",
"ORPMC" and/or "IPMC.""

Section 103 Department of Property Maintenance Inspection. Shall be renamed and known as the "Code Enforcement
Division of the Community Development Department."

Section 103.1 General. Delete in its entirety and insert a new section: "Section 103.1 General. 'The Code Enforcement
Divisionof the Community Development Department is hereby created and the City Manager or his/her duly authorized
designee is in charge thereof shall be known as the code official for the enforcement of the provisions of the Oak Ridge
Property Maintenance Code."

Section 103.5 Fees. Delete in its entirety and Insert a new section: "Section 103.5 Conflict of Interest. No City employee

having investigative or enforcement responsibilities under this code shall be financially benefited or involved in the
furnishing of labor, materials or appliances for the construction, alteration or maintenance of a building, or in the
making of plans or specifications thereof, unless he or she is the owner of such building."

Section 104.5 Notices and Orders. Delete in its entirety and Insert a new section: "Section 104.5 Notices and Orders. The
City Manager or his/her duly authorized designee, the City of Oak Ridge Board of Building and Housing Code Appeals or
the Administrative Hearing Officer shall Issue all necessary notices or orders as needed to ensure compliance with this
code."

Page 1 of 10



Section 106.3 Prosecution of Violation. Delete second sentence in its entirety and insert a new sentence: "Ifthe notice
of violation is not complied with, the City Manager or his designee shall institute the appropriate proceeding at law
including the issuance of A.H.O. citation(s) or in equity to restrain, correct or abate such violation, or to require the
removal or termination of the unlawful occupancy of the property or structure in violation of the provisions of adopted
codes or the order or direction made pursuant thereto."

Section 106.4 Violation Penalties. Delete in its entirety and insert a new section: "Section 106.4 Violation Penalties. It
shall be unlawful for an owner, lessee, occupant or any other person, corporation or other entity to fail to comply with
the provisions of this code or any notice or order by the city manager or his/her duly authorized designee or the Board
of Building and Housing Code of Appeals. Failure to comply with such notice order may be punishable as provided in §1-
107 of this code of ordinances. The imposition of one penalty for any violation shall not excuse the violation or permit it
to continue, and all such persons shall be required to correct or remedy such violations or defects within a reasonable
time. Each day such failure to comply continues beyond the fixed date set by a notice of violation or order for
compliance constitutes a separate offense.

Section 106 Violations. Insert a new section: "Section 106.6 Repeat Violations. Owners, operators or legal occupants of
any occupancy that previously violated provision(s) of this code which ultimately caused the City to abate such
violation{s) any repeat or future violation(s) of the same provision{s) within twelve (12) calendar months shall give cause
to the City to correct or abate the same violation(s) with notice per § 107 of this code with exception of registered mail
requirement at the owners, operators or legal occupants expense and the City may assess unpaid expenses against the
property as a lien.

Exception:

(a) Violations of Unfit for Human Occupation or Use
(b) Change of property ownership, operator or legal occupant"

Section 106 Violations. Insert a new section: "Section 106.7 Recovery of Costs. If any person fails to comply with any
order or notice given under the Oak Ridge Property Maintenance Code, the city manager may cause such structure to be
repaired, altered, improved, vacated, cleaned and sealed or closed, or demolished or removed and the cost of the same
shall be assessed against the owner and shall, upon filing of a notice of lien on the property in the office of register of
deeds in the county in which the property is located, constitute a lien on the property in favor of the city, second only to
liens of the state, county and municipality for taxes, or any other special assessments and any other valid lien, right or
interest in such property duly recorded or duly perfected prior to the filing of such notice. These costs shall be placed
upon the tax roll of the city as a lien, and shall be added to the property tax roll to be collected at the same time and in
the same manner as property taxes are collected. Ifthe owner fails to pay the costs, they may be collected at the same
time and in the same manner as delinquent property taxes are collected, and shall be subject to the same penalty and
Interest as delinquent property taxes. Any cost recovered by the sale of any of the materials of a structure demolished
or removed hereunder shall be credited to the cost of demolition or removal, and any balance remaining shall be
deposited in the chancery court and shall be disbursed by such court to such person(s) found to be entitled thereto.
Nothing in this section shall be construed to impair or limit in any way the power of the city to define and declare
nuisances and to cause their removal or abatement by summary proceeding or otherwise."

Section 106 Violations. Insert a new section: "Section 106.8 Legal Action. The city attorney or the city attorney's duly
authorized designee may institute appropriate action to compel necessary repairs, vacating, demolition or payment of
penalties as provided by notice or order of the city manager, the Board of Building and Housing Code Appeals or the
Administrative Hearing Officer under the City of Oak Ridge adopted building or property maintenance codes."

Section 107 Notice and Orders. Insert a new section: "Section 107.3.1 Complaints, Notice or Orders; service and filing.
Complaints, notices or orders involving decisions of unfit for occupation or use or other non-immediate danger related
notice violations issued by the city manager, or the Board of Building and Housing Code Appeals shall be served upon
persons either personally, electronic mail with confirmed receipt or by registered mail as required, but if the
whereabouts of such persons are unknown and the same cannot be ascertained by the city manager, the board or the

Page 2 of 10



administrative hearing officer in the exercise of reasonable diligence, the city manager or his/her duly authorized
designee or the board shall make affidavit to that effect, then the serving of such complaint or order upon such
person(s) may be made by publishing a legal abstract of the same once each week for two (2) consecutive calendar
weeks in a newspaper or other legally acceptable medium published, posted or distributed in the city at large. Acopy of
such complaint, notice or order shall also be posted in a conspicuous place on the premises affected by the complaint,
notice or order. A copy of such complaint, notice or order shall also be filed for record in the register of deeds of the
county in which the structure or property Is located, and such filing of the complaint, notice or order shall have the same
force and effect as other lis pendens notices provided by law."

Section 107 Notice and Orders, insert a new section: "Section 107.3.2 Presumption. There is hereby created a rebuttable
presumption that the person listed upon the most recent County tax roll as the owner of a property, dwelling, dwelling
unit or structure is the owner for purposes of enforcement of the Oak Ridge Property Maintenance Code."

Section 107.3 Method of Service. At bottom of new section 107.3.2, insert "EXCEPTION: Administrative Hearing Officer

process method of service and process shall be accordance to Title 3, Chapter 6 of the City of Oak Ridge Code of
Ordinances and T.C.A. § 6-54-1001 es seq."

Section 108.1.3 Structure Unfit for Human Occupancy. Delete In its entirety and insert a new section: "Section 108.1.3
Structures Unfit for Human Occupation or Use. Under Tennessee Code Annotated (T.C.A.), §13-21-102, the City has the
power to exercise its police powers to repair, vacate or demolish structures found to be unfit for human occupation or
use if any or all of the following conditions exist due to dilapidation or lack of maintenance, defects increasing the
hazards of fire, accident or other calamities, lack of ventilation, illumination, heating facilities or sanitary facilities,
contains filth and contamination, vermin or rat infested, or due to other conditions rendering such structures defective,
unsafe or unsanitary, or dangerous or detrimental to the health, safety or morals, or otherwise inimical to the welfare of
the residents of the City which therefore constitutes a public nuisance that Is declared unlawful, and shall be repaired,
vacated, demolished or otherwise abated as provided herein or by other applicable law."

Insert a new section: "Section 108.1.3.1 Structural Defects. Structures to be considered unfit for human occupation or

use for structural defects, the following conditions apply but not limited to: those interior vertical wails or other vertical
structural members list, lean or buckle to such an extent that a plumb line passing through the center of gravity falls
outside the middle third of its base; or those which exclusive of the foundation show thirty-three percent (33%) or more
of damage or deterioration of the supporting member(s) of fifty percent (50%) or more of damage or deterioration of
the non-supporting portions of the structure or outside walis or coverings; or those which have improperly distributed
loads upon the floors or roofs or in which the same are overloaded or which have insufficient strength to be reasonably
safe for the purpose used."

Section 108.1.4 Unlawful Structure. Delete In its entirety and insert a new section: "Section 108.1.4 UnlawfulStructure.
An unlawful structure is one found in whole or In part standing incomplete with invalid/expired building permits with no
evidence of a reasonable completion plan from the owner or was erected, altered or occupied contrary to the law or is
or to be occupied by more persons than permitted under this code.

Insert a new section: "Section 108.1.6 Extensive Alterations. When the total area of all the work areas included in an

alteration or repair exceeds 50 percent of the area of the structure or dwelling unit, the work shall be considered a
reconstruction and shall comply with the requirements of the provisions for reconstruction work."

"Exception: Work areas in which the alteration work is exclusively plumbing, mechanical, or electrical shall not
be included in the computation of the total area of all work areas."

Section 109.2 Temporary Safeguards. Modify section by inserting the phrase: "or the recognition of a public or attractive
nuisance" after the existing "imminent danger due to an unsafe condition,..."

Page 3 of 10



Section 110.1 General. Modifythis Section by deleting all references to the "code official" and replace in lieu thereof
"Board of Building and Housing Code Appeals" and delete reference to the "building official" and replace in lieu thereof
"city manager or his/her duly authorized designee".

Section 111 Means of Appeal. Delete in Its entirety and Insert a new section: "Section 111 Board of Building and Housing
Code Appeals.

Section 111.1 The Board of Building and Housing Code Appeals may be referred to as "the board" or "BBHCA" in this
code.

Section 111.2 BBHCA; Appointment.

(a) There is hereby created a board of building and housing code appeals consisting of seven (7) members,
which shall be residents of the City of Oak Ridge, Tennessee and shall consist of the following: one physician
or person from a health related field; one architect or engineer; one building-related contractor or building
supply dealer; one realtor; and three members from the public at large; provided that, if no individuals
meeting these criteria apply for appointment. City Council may appoint persons who do not possess such
qualifications.

(b) Appointment to the board shall be staggered three (3) year terms, provided the terms of members of the
initial board shall be as follows:

(i) Three (3) members from the public at large 3 years
(11) One (1) Physician or other memberfrom health related field 2 years
(ill) One (1) Architect or Engineer 2 years
(iv) One (1) Realtor lyear

(v) One (1) Building related contractor or building supply dealer 1 year
(c) Members of the board may be removed by the City Council for good cause shown.
(d) Vacancies on the board shall be filled by City Council for the unexpired term of such vacancy.
(e) All members of the board shall serve without compensation.
(f) As soon as practical after appointment, the members of the board shall meet and organize by electing a

chairperson, vice-chairperson and secretary. The City Manager or his/her duly authorized designee shall
serve as Ex-Officio. Thereafter, officers of the board shall be elected by the members at the first annual
meeting of the board. Four (4) members shall constitute a quorum and the affirmative vote of at least four
(4) members shall be required to take any action, except to continue a meeting where no quorum is present.
A member shall not act in a case in which such member or his or her family member or employer has a
personal or financial interest. The board shall establish such other written rules and regulation for its own
procedure not inconsistent with the provisions of ORMPC and a copy shall be kept on file with the City Clerk.

(g) All hearings before the board shall be open to the public. The appellant, the appellant's representative, the
City Manager or his/her duly authorized designee and any person whose interests are affected shall be given
the opportunity to be heard.

(h) Any reference in any provision of the Code of Ordinance, City of Oak Ridge, Tennessee to the board of
building code appeals or the board of housing code appeals shall be deemed to refer to the Board of
Building and Housing Code Appeals.

Section 111.3 Duties and Powers of the Board of Building and Housing Code Appeals. The board shall hear all Cityof Oak
Ridge Property Maintenance Code appeals submitted by any person directly affected by a decision of the City Manager
or his/her duly authorized designee or a notice or order issued under this code shall have the right to appeal to the
board in accordance to Section 111.6 of this code.

(a) Board of Building and Housing Code Appeals shall meet monthly or as needed to hear all cases of structures
unfit for human occupation or use and shall hear all appeals of notices for housing violations, if any have
been filed, but in any event shall meet within fifteen (IS) business days after receipt of an application or
notice of appeal ifso requested by the City Manager or his/her duly authorized designee or by the
Appellant.

Page 4 of 10



(b) At such hearings, the board shall hear and receive such relevant testimony and evidence as presented by the
City Manager or his/her duly authorized designee or by the Appellant.

(c) The board shall determine whether the structure is unfit for human occupation or use, whether an appealed
violation exists, whether the City Manager or his/her duly authorized designee's notice of violation is proper
and/or whether a request for an extension of time or waiver shall be granted.

(d) Extensions of time may be granted only upon a showing of undue hardship, or that such is necessary to
complete the abatement of violation, and shall not exceed ninety (90) calendar days from the date the
board's decision. After a hearing, additional extensions may be granted, not to exceed a total of ninety (90)
calendar days, if they are requested at least fifteen (15) business days prior to the expiration of the current
order, provided such extension shall only be granted where the appellant/owner shows that he or she has
been making a good faith effort and progress toward completing the abatement of violation(s), and that
such additional time is necessary.

(e) Anything herein to the contrary notwithstanding, no more than one thirty (30) calendar days extension of
time may be granted to complete board ordered repairs or demolition to any structure that constitutes an
imminent or immediate threat or danger to the health, safety or general welfare of any person or to the
public. As a condition of granting such extension, the board may impose restrictions on the
appellant/owner to secure the property or to take other measures to protect the health, safety and general
welfare of the public.

(f) Upon application, the board is empowered to grant a waiver from specific minimum requirements of this
ordinance, provided however, waivers shall be granted only for unique or special conditions of the dwelling
or structure orthat imposition of the minimum requirement to the applicant would impose an extreme and
undue hardship; and that waiver of the particular requirement would not endanger the health, safety or
welfare of the occupants or the general public, or would not cause or threaten an imminent deterioration of
property values in the area in which such property/structure is located. It is the intent of this provision that
waivers are not to be liberally granted, but rather are intended only for purposes specifically enumerated
herein. Economic hardship alone shall be insufficient reason for granting of a waiver.

(g) Appeals of notice and orders (other than Imminent Danger notices per Section 109 of this code) shall stay
the enforcement of the notice and order until the appeal is heard by the board.

(h) The board shall issue a written decision upholding or dismissing the notice of the City Manager or his/her
duly authorized designee, or modifying the notice to the extent the board determines the order was
improper, or granting or denying an extension of time for compliance or granting or denying a waiver, or
declaring a structure unfit for human occupation or use. Copies of all decisions shall be given to the City
Manager or his/her duly authorized designee and the appellant/owner, and filed with the city clerk.

(i) The board shall also hear appeals under the building code or any other city code wherein the board is
designated to hear appeals.

(j) The board shall further have the duty, in accordance with § 11-105 of the Code of Ordinances, City of Oak
Ridge, Tennessee, to receive and investigate complaints of discrimination in housing, and to recommend
ways of eliminating any Injustices caused thereby.

Section 111.4 Standards for Repair, Vacation or Demolition. The following standards shall be followed In substance by
the BBHCA in ordering repair, vacation or demolition of a structure unfit for human occupation or use:

(a) If the structure can reasonably be repaired, altered or improved so that it will no longer exist in violation of
the provisions of this code, it shall be ordered repaired, altered or improved to render the structure fit for
human occupation or use or to vacate and close the structure as a place of human occupation or use.

(b) If the structure is fifty percent (50%) or more damaged or decayed or in disrepair from its value or condition
prior to becoming a nuisance, and it is otherwise unreasonable to repair, it shall be ordered vacated and
demolished or removed.

(c) In any case where the structure is abandoned or in such a condition as to make it dangerous to the health,
safety or general welfare of Its occupants or the general public, it shall also be ordered vacated and the
BBHCA may additionally order the structure and the property to be secured in such a manner to protect the

Page 5 of 10



health, safety or general welfare of the public or persons on the property until such repairs or demolition
has been completed, or may order other immediate actions reasonably necessary.

Section 111.5 Duties of the City Manager or his/her duly authorized designee.
(a) Whenever a petition Is filed with the city manager by at least five {5) residents of the city that a structure is

unfit for human occupation or use or is in violation of the Oak Ridge Property Maintenance Code, or
whenever it appears to the city manager (upon the city managers own motion) that a structure is unfit for
human occupation or use, the city manager shall, if the city managers preliminary investigation discloses a
basis for such charges, issue and cause to be served upon the owner and parties in interest of such structure
a complaint stating the specific charge(s) and containing a notice that a hearing will be held before the
BBHCA at a place fixed therein, no less than ten (10) calendar days and no more than thirty (30) calendar
days after serving the notice; provided that by mutual agreement the time for the hearing may be lessened
or extended. Such notice shall state that:

(i) The owner and parties in interest shall be given the right to file an answer to the complaint and
to appear in person, or otherwise, and to give testimony at the hearing.

(ii) The rules of evidence prevailing in a court of law or equity shall not be controlling at the hearing.
(b) If, after such notice and hearing, the BBHCA determines that a structure is unfit for human occupation or

use, the board shall issue written findings of fact in support of such determination and shall issue and cause
to be served upon the owner thereof an order to repair, vacate or demolish the structure, in accordance to
Section 110 of this code, and shall provide a reasonable time for the compliance not to exceed ninety (90)
calendar days.

(c) Ifthe owner fails to comply with an order or to vacate and close the structure, the BBHCA may cause such
structure to be repaired or to be vacated and closed and shall cause to be posted at the main entrance to
the structure so closed a placard stating: "This building is unfitfor human occupation or use. The use or
occupation of this building for human occupation or use is prohibited and unlawful."

(d) If the owner fails to comply with an order to demolish or remove the structure, the city manager may cause
such structure to be demolished or removed.

(e) For any structure that has been ordered vacated during the repairs or demolition of the structure, the
owner of the structure shall cause to be posted at the main entrance to the structure a placard stating: "This
structure has been found to be unfit for human occupation or use. Thisnotice is to remain posted
conspicuously on the property until the structure is repaired or demolished."

Section 111.6 Right to Appeal. Any person receiving or aggrieved by a notice issued by the city manager or his/her duly
authorized designee pursuant to the Oak Ridge Property Maintenance Code, except environmental violations (including
but not limited to weeds, vines, bushes and hedges, motor vehicles abandoned or inoperable or otherwise illegal, and
accumulation of rubbish and garbage) which appeals are handled by the community development department of the
City of Oak Ridge, may appeal such notice to the Board of Building and Housing Code Appeals. The appeal may contest
the fact of the violation(s) set forth In the notice or may request additional time to comply with the notice.

(s) Form. The appeal shall be made on a form prescribed by the board or the city, which form shall minimally
identify the name of the appellant, the property on which the violation(s) is said to occur and the date of the
notice and shall contain a statement of why the appeal is made and what relief is sought.

(b) Timeframe. Such appeal must be filed with the city manager or his/her duly authorized designee within ten
(10) calendar days of the date of the notice, or within three (3) business days from the date of the notice for
environmental violation to the community development director or his/her duly authorized designee of the
City of Oak Ridge.

(c) Extension of time to complete. Ifthe owner has undertaken in good faith to correct the violation as set forth
in the notice, the owner may request an extension of time to complete the cleanup, repairs or demolition
provided the owner files such a request with the city manager or his/her duly authorized designee at least
ten (10) business days prior to the date such cleanup, repairs or demolition where ordered to be completed.
While the board may waive this ten (10) calendar day requirement for good cause shown, no request for an
extension of time shall be filed after the expiration of the time of completion set forth in the notice. The

Page 6 of 10



decision made by the community development department will be final and the extension of time will not
be granted.

Section 111.6.1 Right to Appeal an Order Declaring a Structure Unfit for Human Occupation or Use.
(a) Asset forth in state law, any person affected by an order declaring a structure to be a non-imminent danger

unfit for human occupation or use may file a bill in the chancery court for an injunction restraining the
BBHCAfromcarrying out the provisions of the order, and the court may, upon the filing of such bill, issue a
temporary injunction restraining the board pending the final disposition of the cause; provided, that within
sixty (60) calendar days after the posting and service of the order of the board, such person shall file such
bill in the court.

(b) The court shall hear and determine the issues raised and shall enter such final order or decree as law and

justice may require. In ail such proceedings, the findings of the board as to facts, if supported by evidence,
shall be conclusive. Costs shall be in the discretion of the court. The remedies herein provided shall be
exclusive remedies, and no person affected by an order of the board shall be entitled to recover any
damages for action taken pursuant to any order of the board, or because of non-compliance by such person
with any order of the board.

Section 112.4 Failure to Comply. Delete in its entirety and Insert a new: "Section 112.4 Failure to Comply. Any person
who shall continue any work after having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is
directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be liable and subject to penalties of not less than
$50.00 or more than $500.00 per violation and as set forth in Section 106.4 of this code."

Section 202 General Definitions. Delete title "General Definitions" and Insert a new title: "General Definitions and

Phrases"; also insert respectively:

"Abandoned Motor Vehicle. A motor vehicle or trailer or recreational vehicle designed to be towed by a motor
vehicle that is left unattended on public property for more than thirty (30) calendar days; is in an obvious state
of disrepair and Is left unattended on public property for more than ten (10) calendar days; has remained
illegally parked or placed on public property for any period of time exceeding forty-eight (48) consecutive hours;
has remained on private property without the consent of the owner or person in control of the property for any
period of time exceeding forty-eight (48) consecutive hours."

"Administrative Hearing Officer (A.H.O). City of Oak Ridge created by ordinance ff01-2014, amending ORMC
Title 3 by creating a new chapter 6, Titled "Administrative Hearing Officer" to hear building and property

maintenance code violations, issue orders, levy fines, etc. in accordance with Tennessee Code Annotated § 6-54-
1001 et seq."

"Antique Motor Vehicle. A motor vehicle over twenty-five (25) years old with a non-modified engine and body
which is used for participation in club activities, exhibits, tours, parades and similar uses as a collector's item,
but in no event used for general transportation."

"Any and all other objectionable, unsightly or unsanitary matter of whatever nature, means any condition,
object, material or other matterthat is dangerous or detrimental to human life or health; that renders the
ground, the water, the air or food a hazard or likely to cause injury to human life or health; that is offensive to
the senses; or that threatens to become detrimental to the public health. The term includes but is not limited to
any abandoned wells, pools, landscape water features, shafts or basements; abandoned refrigerators; stagnant
or unwholesome water; sinks; privies; filth; carrion; rubbish; junk, trash, debris or refuse; impure or
unwholesome matter of any kind; and any matter, condition or object which is objectionable, unsightly or
unsanitary to a person of ordinary sensitivities."

Page 7 of 10



"Attractive Nuisance. The doctrine in tort lawwhich holds that one who maintains a dangerous instrumentality
on his or her property which is likely to attract children is under a duty to reasonably protect those children
against the dangers of that attraction."

"Bushes and Hedges, means vegetative growth or plant that includes but not limited to holly, box hedges,
azaleas, roses, rhododendrons, laurel, lilac, hibiscus and evergreens."

"Corner VisibilityTriangle, means a triangular area formed within a corner lot bythe intersecting lot linesabutting
the streets or the projections thereof and a straight line connecting them 7.5 meters (24.6 feet) from their point of
Intersection."

"Driveway Visibility Triangle, means a triangular area formed by the intersection of the lateral limitofthe
travelled portion of a driveway and a lot line abutting a street or the projections thereof and a straight line
connecting them 4.57 meters (15 feet) from their point of intersection."

Delete "Inoperable motor vehicle" and insert new definition: "Inoperable Motor Vehicle. A vehicle, motor
vehicle or trailer or recreational vehicle designed to be towed by a motor vehicle which cannot be driven or
operated upon the public streets for reason including but not limited to being unlicensed, unregistered,
wrecked, abandoned, in a state of disrepair causing unsafe operation, one or more flat tires or incapable of
being moved under Its own intended power."

"Lot or parcel of real estate, includes, in addition to those grounds within their respective boundaries, all lots or
parcels of ground lying and being adjacent thereto and extending beyond the property line of any such lot or
parcel of real estate to the curb-line of adjacent streets where a curb-line has been established, and any
abutting rights-of-way beyond the property line where no curb-line has been established and also to the center
of adjacent alleys."

"Natural Landscaped Area - Natural landscaping, also called native gardening, is the use of native plants,
including trees, shrubs, groundcover, and grasses which are indigenous to the geographic area of the garden
which is either naturally established or designed and cultivated that when established will sustain itself with
minimal maintenance effort that do not contain noxious weeds or poisonous plants that cause a public
nuisance."

"Nuisance. Use of property or course of conduct that interferes with the legal rights of others by causing
damage, annoyance, or inconvenience which can also be considered an attractive or public nuisance.

"Parties of Interest. Means all individuals, associations, corporations and others who have interests of record in
a structure and any who are in possession thereof."

"Place of Public Accommodation. Means any building or structure in which goods are supplied or services
performed, or in which the trade of the general public is solicited."

"Public Nuisance. Means a nuisance which affects numerous members of the public or the public at large (how
many people it takes to make a public is unspecified), as distinguished from a nuisance which only does harm to
a neighbor or a few private individuals. A public nuisance is an unreasonable Interference with the public's right
to property. It includes conduct that interferes with public health, safety, peace or convenience. The

unreasonableness may be evidenced by statute, or by the nature of the act, including how long, and how bad,
the effects ofthe activity may be. All structures and appurtenances which are found unfit for human occupation
or use within the terms of § 108.1.3 as determined by the Board of Building and Housing Code Appeals are also
considered a public nuisance."

Page 8 of 10



"Rental Unit. Dwelling, dwelling unit, rooming unit, or sleeping unit or any part of a structure used as a home,
residence, or sleeping unit by a single person, household unit byany person(s) other than the legalowner of the
property which is leased, rented, or otherwise occupied from the owner or other person in control of such
unit(s), whether by day, week, month, year or any other term, regardless of monetary exchange."

"Swimming Pool. Means any structure intended for swimming or recreational bathing that contains water more
than 24 inches {610 mm) deep. This includes in-ground, above-ground and on-ground swimming pools, hot tubs
and spas.

"Trash and Debris, means all manner of refuse. Including but not limited to mounds of dirt, compost, piles of
leaves, grass and weed clippings, paper trash, useless fragments of building material, rubble, household items
and appliances, items of salvage such as scrap metal and wood, barrels, tires, objects that hold water for an
extended time, tree and brush trimmings, and other miscellaneous wastes or rejected matter."

"Turf grass - refers to all species of grass that are perennial and are typically used for lawns."

"Vines, means a vegetative growth or plant with a long stem that grows along the ground or climbs a support
such as, but not limited to: Clematis, Climbing Roses, Honey Suckle, Ivy, Jasmine, Morning Glory, Trumpet Vines,
and Wisteria."

"Weeds - a plant other than trees, shrubs, turf grass and cultivated flowers or gardens that is not valued where
it is growing and is usually of vigorous growth; especially one that tends to overgrow or choke out more
desirable plants."

Section 302.4 Weeds. Insert height in bracket: "10 inches"

Section 302.4 Weeds. Insert new section: "302.4.1 Accumulation or Condition Declared Unlavrful.

(a) Whenever and wherever weeds, shrubbery, rubbish or any other objectionable, unsightly and unsanitary
matter of whatever nature shall exist, covering or partly covering the surface of any lot or parcel of real
estate within the city so as to produce an unsightly appearance or which may harbor reptiles or rodents,
create a fire hazard or result in unsanitary conditions, such a condition is declared to be unlawful, the
abatement of which shall be a public necessity.

(b) Vines that cover 50 percent or more of the ground surface area in a residential front yard, to include side
yards if visible from the street, shall not exceed 12 inches in height. Vines used as ground cover, shall be cut
back so they do not grow onto any curb, sidewalk, or driveway.

(c) Bushes and hedges shall be trimmed to prevent encroachment on any sidewalk, walk-way or extend over
the curb or edge of a street. Bushes and hedges shall not be allowed to create a visibilitytriangle issue for
vehicles or pedestrians."

Insert new section: "302.4.2 Natural Landscaped Area, Native Gardens shall be allowed for the purposes of vegetated
buffers, stormwater retention and control, stabilizing slopes and preventing erosion, supporting birds and other
desirable wildlife and establishment of plant communities' native to this region. Natural landscaped areas and native
gardens shall not violate the provisions of this code or have a negative impact on any structures or appurtenances nor
be permitted to become a public nuisance or fire hazard as determined by the authority having jurisdiction.

Insert new section. "Section 302.10 Dog to be controlled so as to not commit nuisances. It shall be unlawful for any
person owning or having control or custody of any dog to permit the animal to defecate upon the public property of this
City or upon the private property of another unless the person immediately remove the feces and properly dispose of it;
provided, however, that nothing herein contained authorizes such person to enter upon the private property of another
without permission."

Page 9 of 10



Insert new sub-section. "Section 302.10.1 Suitable container or instrument for removal. It shall be unlawful for any
person to walk a dog on public property of this City or upon the private property of another without carrying at all times
a suitable container or other suitable Instrument for the removal and disposal of dogfeces."

Insert new sub-section. "Section 302.10.2 Seeing Eye Dog. Visually handicapped persons who use Seeing Eye Guide Dogs
are exempt from this law."

Section 304.14 Insect Screens. Insert dates in two brackets respectively: "April 1"... "November 1"

Section 304.10 Stairways, decks, porches and balconies. Insert new language to continue sentence: "and shall not be
used for outdoor storage of excessive trash, junk, debris or items with intended purpose for indoor use.

Section 308.1 Accumulation of rubbish or garbage. Insert after "...property and premises," new language to sentence:
"including decks, porches, and open carports..."

Section 602.3 Heat Supply. Insert dates in two brackets respectively: "September 1" ... "May 1"

Section 602.4 Occupiable Work Spaces. Insert dates in two brackets respectively: "September 1" ... "May 1"

Appendix A, Boarding Standards. A102 Materials insert new subsection "Section A102.4 Other approved method{s). The
city manager may allow alternative means or methods of boarding structures meeting the intent of this code in the
event the requirement herein is determined to be impractical or cost infeasible."

Section 3. That Ordinance No. of The City of Oak Ridge entitled [FILL IN HERE THE COMPLETE TITLE OF THE
LEGISLATION OR LAWS IN EFFECT AT THE PRESENTTIME SO THATTHEYWILL BE REPEALED BY DEFINITE MENTION]

and all other ordinances or parts of laws in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

Section 4. That if any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this legislation is, for any reason, held to be
unconstitutional, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance. The City of Oak
Ridge City Council hereby declares that it would have passed this law, and each section, subsection, clause or phrase
thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, clauses and phrases be declared
unconstitutional.

Section 5. That nothing in this legislation or in the Property Maintenance Code hereby adopted shall be construed to
affect any suit or proceeding impending in any court, or any rights acquired, or liability incurred, or any cause or causes
of action acquired or existing, under any act or ordinance hereby repealed as cited in Section 3 of this law; nor shall any
just or legal right or remedy of any character be lost, impaired or affected by this legislation.

Section 6. That the Oak Ridge City Clerk is hereby ordered and directed to cause this legislation notification to be
published on the City of Oak Ridge Website and in a newspaper having general circulation in the City of Oak Ridge.

Section 7. That this law and the rules, regulations, provisions, requirements, orders and matters established and
adopted hereby shall take effect and be in full force and effect [TIME PERIOD] from and after the date of its final
passage and adoption.

Page 10 of 10



Date: September 4, 2014

Place: Oak Ridge, Tennessee

Subject: EQAB Releases First Progress Report for Oak Ridge's Climate Action Plan

The Oak Ridge Environmental Quality Advisory Board (EQAB) has released the first progress report on

the City's Climate Action Plan (CAP). The CAPset goals for the reduction of greenhouse gas (GHG)

emissions by City government as well as the entire community. The report can be accessed on the City's

website at http://oakridgetn.gov/department blank.aspx?article=2157

Oak Ridge has made substantial progress in energy conservation and energy efficiency since adopting

the CAP. By2012, GHG emissions from City government operations had fallen 6% below the 2004

baseline while Community emissions were 3% below the baseline emissions. If these trends continue,

the City will meet or exceed its 2015 goals for GHG reductions. Some specific achievements include:

• GHG emissions associated with energy used in City buildings decreased 20%.

• Electricity for traffic signals decreased by about 60% as a result of transition to Light Emitting

Diode (LED) technology.

• The City has completed a home energy retrofit demonstration project as a model for potential
energy efficiency improvements in many older Oak Ridge homes.

• Annual electricity consumption by the average household in Oak Ridge has been decreasing by
about 95 kilowatt-hours per year (on average) over the last 11 years.

• The City has received a leadership award from the Tennessee Valley Authority for outstanding
participation in the Green Power Switch renewable energy program.

• Oak Ridge is the first Green Power Community (GPC) in Tennessee and is the first GPC in the US
Environmental Protection Agency's Region 4, which includes much of the southeastern United
States.

"We are very proud of the progress that Oak Ridge has made toward the CAP goals, and believe that

continued reductions in emissions from municipal and community sources are possible" said Steve

Kenworthy, the EQAB Chairperson. "One significant challenge we face Is maintaining the City's

commitment to achieving these ambitious goals, including the essential task of tracking energy

consumption in City operations and by Oak Ridge residents and businesses"

EQAB was directed by City Council in 2012 to develop and implement a progress reporting system for

the CAP, which was adopted by Council on December 14, 2010.

Contact: Stephen Kenworthy, EQAB Chairperson. (865) 202-4271, stkkts@gmail.com



li
Jl

'•\{Vfrvr V-



5/1/2014

Oak Ridge Climate Action Plan Progress Report

Purpose and Scope

The primary purpose of this report is to summarize progress made in meeting the greenhouse gas (GHG)

reduction goals adopted by City Council in December 2010 in approving the Climate Action Plan for the

City of Oak Ridge (CAP). Separate goals were set for the city government and the rest of the community.

If recent trends continue, Oak Ridge will meet both of the reduction goals set for 2015 in the CAP. By

2012, City GHG emissions were 6% below the 2004 baseline (See Figure 1 below, and Explanatory Note 1

at the end of this document). Community emissions for 2012 were 3% below the baseline year

emissions.

The remainder of this report:

• Provides detail on City and community GHG emissions

• Highlights recent improvements in energy efficiency of municipal operations

• Describes City initiatives to encourage Oak Ridge residents and businesses to save energy and

reduce GHG emissions

• Discusses the prospects for continued progress toward the CAP GHG reduction goals

• Offers recommendations for City tracking of progress toward CAP goals

• Identifies specific near-term opportunities to work toward achieving CAP goals

800,000

« 700,000
c
0
'tn 600,000
in

1 500,000
5 400,000
>.

•£ 300,000
3

I 200,000
o

^ 100,000

Oak Ridge GHG emissions (tons/yr)

0!^ a

•10% -♦^^-30%

-50%

-50%

-80%

40,000

35,000

30,000 «
o

25,000 »
£

20,000

X

15,000 «
>

10,000 U

5,000

0

2000 2010 2020 2030 2040 2050 2060

O Community --♦--CommunityGoals A City -^-CityGoals

Figure 1. City and Community GHG emissions (tons/year, See note 3) and CAP goals for future
reductions. Reduction goals are specified as a percentage relative to the 2004 baseline emissions (red
symbols).



5/1/2014

City Emissions

Total annual GHG emissions(note 2) for the City of Oak Ridge have decreased since the baseline year

2004 (Figure 2). On average, electricity consumption accounts for about 85% of total City emissions,

while use of transportation fuels and natural gas account for 11% and 3% respectively.

30,000

25,000

20,000

15,000

10,000

5,000

0

Oak Ridge Municipal GHG emissions (eC02 tons/year)

2004 Baseline = 27,101 tons
.--O--

O

—^——K

—^
A— —ft——A A—

"IT"
5K

2004 2005 2006 2007 2010 2011 2012

Cateeorv 1% of 2004 GHG)

O Total (100%)

)( Water/sewer (54.9%)

-©-Buildings(19.5%)

ifli Lighting (14.7%)

• Transportation (6.3%)

•Commute (4.6%)

Figure 2. City GHG emissions by sector, (see note 3)Electnc power for water and sewer

systems is the biggest contributor of city GHG emissions.

Changes in City GHG emissions since 2004

• Total City GHG emissions for 2012 were 6% lower than for the 2004 baseline year.

• GHG emissions associated with pumping water and wastewater decreased by 7%

• GHG emissions associated with energy used in City buildings decreased 20%.

• GHG emissions associated with electricity for traffic signals decreased by about
60% as a result of transition to Light Emitting Diodes.

• GHG emissions associated with electricity for street lights increased by 12%

• GHG emissions associated with use of city vehicles Increased by over 34%



5/1/2014

Measures that are reducing City emissions

Improvements to Municipal Buildings: Recent renovations such as installation of digital controls for

heating and cooling systems at the Central Services Complex have been effective in reducing energy

use. For the years 2010 through 2012, average electric power consumption at the Central Services

Complex, Civic Center, Library, and Municipal Building combined was 22% less than the 2004

baseline. These four facilities account for around 85% of all electricity used In City buildings.

A current project to upgrade lighting at the Municipal Building, CivicCenter, and Public Library will

provide additional GHG reductions and cost savings. These upgrades will be funded in part by the

Tennessee Clean Energy Grant Program.

Traffic signals and street lights: Since the adoption of the CAP, the City has replaced 82% of the

traffic lights with energy efficient light-emitting diodes (LED). This decreased power use for traffic

signals by almost 60%.

In contrast, the number of Citystreet lights has increased by 9% since 2004, and electric power for

street lights accounts for over 14% of all municipal electric power use. There are plans for

experimental use of high efficiency, dark-skies compliant LED street lighting in selected locations. If

the test is successful and LED street lighting is adopted citywide, energy savings of 40-50% may be

possible.

Water and wastewater infrastructure: Water and wastewater operations account for roughly 65% of

all municipal electricity consumption. Pumping water from Melton Hill Lake to the City water

treatment plant accounts for almost 20% of total municipal electric use. For 2010-2012, GHG

emissions due to using electricity in water and wastewater operations were 7% below 2004 levels.

Electricity use for drinking water and wastewater pumping increased, probably because of new

residential subdivisions, but large decreases in lake water pumping after 2010 resulted in an overall

decrease in electric use and associated GHG emissions.

Replacement of older, inefficient pumps, motors, and control systems provides gains in energy

efficiency and system reliability. Ongoing work to decrease stormwater inflows to the sanitary sewer

collection system and to accelerate the replacement of wastewater pumping facilities will also save

energy in the coming years. Similarly, a planned project to replace the raw water intake motors and

booster pumps that serve the city water treatment facility will provide significant energy savings.

Fuel efficiency of City vehicles: With funding assistance from a joint program of the US Department

of Energy, Electric Power Research Institute, and Tennessee Valley Authority, the Electric

Department is acquiring a plug-in hybrid bucket truck and a plug-in hybrid pickup truck that will help

reduce City GHG emissions.

Municipal recycling: Most City facilities now participate in the Oak Ridge single stream recycling

program, thereby reducing the demand for energy to produce new products (e.g. aluminum cans

and paper products) from virgin materials.



5/1/2014

Community Emissions

Community GHG emissions were unusually low in the baseline year of 2004 (Figure 1, note 4), in part

because of a relatively cool summer that year. Total emissions for 2012 were 3% below these 2004

baseline levels following a period of somewhat higher emissions (Figure 3). The recent downward trend

in GHG emissions results from a combination of two factors; (1) decreasing electricity demand and (2) a

decrease in the carbon intensity (GHG per kWh generated) of TVA power since 2010 (note 5). Meeting

the CAP 5% reduction goal for 2015 will depend on both of these factors. Annual electricity use by the

average Oak Ridge household has been decreasing by about 95 kWh per year (on average) over the last

11 years (2003-2013, note 6), and estimated community energy use for transportation (note 7) is down

by about 7% since 2004.

800,000

700,000

600,000

500,000

400,000

300,000

200,000

100,000

Oak Ridge Community GHG Emissions (eC02 tons/year)

2004 2005 2006 2007 2010 2011 2012

2004 Baseline = 653,727 tons

Cateeorv(%of 2004 GHG)

O Total (100%)

" "♦ Residential (24%)

B Commercial (40%)

•A' Transportation (36%)

Figure 3. Community GHG emissions by sector.(see note 3).

City actions that are reducing community emissions

City-supported programs/projects that are helping reduce community emissions include:

• Bike and pedestrian enhancements: The various transportation enhancement projects to

improve bicycle and pedestrian safety that have been completed since 2011 encourage human-

powered travel and reduce automobile emissions.

• Economic development and communitv revitalization: Efforts to make Oak Ridge a better place

to shop and work also help reduce GHG emissions because they reduce residents' travel for

shopping and commuting. Thus, City efforts that encourage new retail development and City

support for preservation and redevelopment of the Alexander Inn and Jackson Square are

contributing to meeting the goals of the CAP.

• Recvcline: Curbside single-stream recycling for Oak Ridge households reduces the amount of
waste we send to the landfill and can reduce GHG emissions by decreasing energy used to
produce new products (e.g. aluminum cans and paper products) from virgin materials (note 8).



5/1/2014

Promotion of green power: The City Electric Department and TVA developed a direct-mail

promotion of the TVA Green Power Switch program, which allows City utility customers to

purchase electric power from renewable sources. Participation in this voluntary program has

increased steadily since 2004, with residential purchases of Green Power increasing 25% by

2013 and commercial purchases increasing tenfold. Recently, the City has received a leadership

award from the TVAfor outstanding participation in the Green Power Switch program.

Home energy efficiency: The home energy efficiency demonstration project that the City Is

conducting on Lansing Road in anticipation of the TVA Extreme Energy Makeover grant program

will be a model for energy improvements in many Oak Ridge homes. The City's Extreme Energy

Makeover grant proposal, if successful, will provide energy makeovers for targeted groups of

less energy efficient homes in older Oak Ridge neighborhoods, thus reducing GHG emissions

{and energy bills) for some residents and helping other property owners see how they can

achieve similar results.

DOE Electric Vehicle Project. The City took advantage of this DOE program and installed electric

vehicle charging stations at 5 public locations around the city, reducing vehicle emissions by

encouraging use of electric vehicles.

Urban forest management. The City is working with faculty and graduate students from the

University of Tennessee to conduct a municipal tree inventory. This inventory of trees in the

right-of-way along major road corridors and in parks and other public spaces will be a useful tool

for development of an urban forest management plan. Trees help offset community GHG

emissions by storing atmospheric carbon, as well as providing shade and other benefits.

Factors Affecting Continued Progress in Reducing Emissions

Future progress in reducing municipal GHG emissions will depend on concerted City efforts to improve

energy efficiency as the City grows and municipal services expand. The City can also encourage private-

sector efforts to save energy and reduce GHG emissions through such measures as public education,

demonstration projects, and public recognition of successful private initiatives. City and community GHG

reductions will be aided by continued improvements in vehicle technologies and any additional shift in

the mix of TVA power sources away from coal and toward cleaner natural gas, nuclear and renewable

options (note 9). The effectiveness of state and federal programs dealing with energy and greenhouse

gases will also influence the success of Oak Ridge's future efforts to reduce emissions.



5/1/2014

Recommendations

To aid in future tracking of climate action progress, as well as to raise consciousness about opportunities

to reduce GHG emissions, EQAB recommends that the City track and report annual municipal and

community energy use, including the following specific activities:

• Inter-link municipal system information management systems (e.g. sewer information

management system, new utility billing system, updated accounting software, etc

• Implement a vehicle inventory and maintenance information system that assigns a unique

identifier for each vehicle, and track fuel use and mileage for ail municipal vehicles

• Record units ofenergyconsumption (e.g., kWh, ft^natural gas, gallons offuel) in City financial
accounting systems.

• Estimate total annual employee commuting distance based on employee residency.

EQAB also recommends that the City develop and implement a broad environmental management/

sustainability program that covers all aspects of local government and municipal operations. An

essential component to include is a standard set of procedures for program tracking and evaluation,

such as the International Organization for Standardization (ISO) 14001 standards. Elements of a City

sustainability program could include, for example: public outreach and education, annual progress

reports, green purchasing and contracting policies, facility energy audits, etc.

City and Community Opportunities

The CAP recommended a number of climate action measures that are unlikely to be implemented soon.

There are, however, several near-term opportunities for the City and community to further reduce our

greenhouse gas impacts:

• Solicit energy efficiency audits of Cityfacilities (and operations) that can lead to energy savings

performance contract arrangements which pay for efficiency improvement projects with the

resulting energy savings. For example, the Anderson County School system has recently initiated

this type of energy retrofit project for their facilities.

• Explore options for encouraging community recycling such as providing recycling containers at

apartment complexes and in City parks.

• Establish a community-supported tree planting and urban forest conservation program to

highlight potential benefits such as reduced heating and cooling costs, stormwater runoff

control, and enhanced carbon sequestration.

• Encourage and support community gardens and local farmers' markets to emphasize the

benefits of consuming locally grown food

• Encourage and support redevelopment strategies that emphasize reuse of existing facilities,

building sites, and infrastructure, and the use of sustainable development techniques and green

building practices.



5/1/2014

Explanatory Notes

1: In this report, 6HG emissions are given in units of carbon dioxide equivalents (eC02); or the mass of
C02 that would produce the same degree of radiant energy climate forcing (greenhouse effect) as the
sum of all GHG emissions (i.e. C02 plus other GHG, such as methane). GHG Emissions were estimated on
the basis of energy use data provided by the City of Oak Ridge (electric and municipal transportation fuel
consumption) and the Oak Ridge Utilities District (natural gas consumption). Community vehicle
emissions were based on Tennessee Department of Transportation (TDOT) data (see note 7). GHG
emissions were modeled with the Clean Air and Climate Protection (CACP) software package.

2: Quantities reported include direct GHG emissions from electric power sources and City vehicles only
and do not include GHG emissions arising from the production and transport of products purchased by
the city government.

3: Data for 2004-2007 were collected during the development of the CAP. To use city resources
efficiently and better focus our efforts, only data for 2010-2012, which were deemed representative of
usage trends since finalization of the CAP, were collected and evaluated for this progress report.

4: Commercial power consumption in 2004 was considerably lowerthan in previous years, as the
number of large commercial customers (> 50kW) dropped from 421 to 383 in that year. (Oak Ridge
Electric Dept. Memorandum 14-04, February 19, 2014)

5: The average grid electricity coefficients (e.g. lbs C02/MWh) for the Southeastern Electric Reliability
Council (excluding Florida) were selected as the basis for estimating GHG emissions associated with
electric power use in the CACP model. The carbon intensity of this power generating base decreased
from 1464 lbs C02/MWh in 2004 to 1402 lbs C02/MWh in 2012 (a reduction of 4.2%)

6: Oak Ridge Electric Dept. Memorandum 14-04, February 19, 2014

7: Community vehicle emissions were based on TDOTannual estimates of daily vehicle miles traveled
(VMT) for the urbanized areas of Anderson County. Estimated VMTfor this region have decreased
steadily since 2002.

8:The net impact of recycling on GHG emissions depends on a number of factors including the amounts
and types of materials recycled, the distances to disposal and recycling facilities, and whether landfill gas
is recovered and used as an energy source.

9: The actual carbon intensity of TVA-generated power is almost certainly lower than the Southeastern
Electric Reliability Council rates used in the CACP model to estimate GHG emissions. TVA local
distributor as-delivered rates (as calculated by TVA using industry standard carbon accounting practices)
are less than 1200 lbs C02/MWh since 2009. EPA-provided TVA rate estimates for 2004-2007 range
between 1300 and 1400 lbs C02/MWh. As a result, the GHG estimates provided in the CAP and in this
progress report are conservative (likely to be higher than actual) estimates.


	September 22, 2014 Agenda
	TVA Wholesale Power Rate Increase
	Composition of Elder Citizens Advisory Board
	International Property Maintenance Code
	EQAB's Releases First Progress Report for 


